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Friday, September 13, 2013

APPARITION OF THE VIRGIN MARY IN VITÓRIA, ESPÍRITO SANTO, BRAZIL, TO THE VISIONARIES
FRIAR ELÍAS DEL SAGRADO CORAZÓN DE JESÚS AND SISTER LUCÍA DE JESÚS

Friar Elias del Sagrado Corazón de Jesús transmits the Words of the Virgin Mary:

Dear Children,

Today, I am kneeling before you, because I am contemplating the Eucharistic Body of My Son, the
One who is adored and venerated in all places of the world, because through adoration, peace will
also be attained.

Remember that My Son awaits you both in silence and in merciful prayer.

Today, I reveal to you this act of reverence so that you may imitate it with Me and remember that
before the Thrones of God, reverence is always due.

Today, dear children, is the first day of the consecration of the whole world to My Most Sacred
Immaculate Heart. Therefore, I am kneeling before you to accompany you, because I am just like
you, dear children, I keep the Purity within Me, I keep the Creator God, the God of Love, the same
God that all must seek.

I Am your Mother, dear children, the Most Holy Queen of Peace. And tonight, dear children, I come
to bring you the Presence of the Spirit of God, in honor of the consecration that this state of Brazil
has made before God and before My merciful and maternal presence.

We will also pray for the priests, so that they may be the living symbol of the Presence of My Son
and may represent, before the return of Christ, the true shepherds of Love.

And, in My maternal presence, I bring you a little piece of Fatima, where God also set His Eyes for
the whole world.

Sacrifice and prayer will also lead you to live in purity.

Dear children, begin with small acts of love, sacrificing that which no longer serves you, and you
will come to see how God will cherish that act and consider it an act of love and redemption.

Therefore, today I am in the company of Jacinta and Sister Lucia, My two beloved pilgrims of the
Immaculate Heart of Mary. Today, I have brought them before you, dear children, so that you may
remember that in simplicity and humility, God is found, just as He is found in these little ones.

Let us pray before the Portal of Heaven, for the consecration of the world. On October 13th of this
year, My Heart will expand in Fatima, to honor the Presence of God in the universe and humbly
show the world that it is time to change from the heart.
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Prayers:

Our Father (seven times in Portuguese).

Gloria (seven times in Portuguese).

Hail Mary (seven times in Portuguese).

 

Dear children, Sister Lucia will speak to you:

"It is through prayer that one truly enters the Sacred Hearts."

And now, Jacinta will say something to you:

"Dear sheep, through sacrifice in your lives, however small it may be, you will truly find Paradise.
Sacrifice will lead you to purification, and thus you will find the Peace of our Mother. Imitate our
example, through love and devotion".

Dear children, today I allow them to speak to you so that they may be a living testimony in your
lives that it is possible to achieve the transformation of the heart.

Dear children, a Paradise of Light and Love awaits you.

Go and do works of charity so that all may be united to God and, in this most definitive time, Mercy
descends instead of Justice.

 

Sister Lucía de Jesús transmits the Words of the Virgin Mary:

On this night, I want to tell you that I heard your requests, even before you wrote them on these
little papers, and even those who did not write them down, I heard them.

Today, My children, I hear the pleas of each of your hearts and, tonight, I tell you that the openness
of your hearts allowed the consecration of this city and this state to My Heart.

Today, I thank you for having come to meet Me, for having united your little hearts to Mine and,
together with this praise that your angels make to God, let us glorify the Creator, because many
nations of the world, through the spiritual opening of this day, consecrate themselves to My Sacred
Heart.

I only ask you to keep in the memory of your lives, of your consciences, what you experienced with
Me on this night, for your souls will remember this moment for all eternity.

This encounter with My Sacred Heart marks the beginning of the consecration of the world and
indicates to all the hearts of this Earth that My Peace will triumph and that My Light will be greater
than all the darkness of the world.
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Prepare, as of today, My children, your little hearts to receive My Son. He too, from Heaven, thanks
you for having opened your hearts.

Today, I tell you that through Communion with the Eucharistic Body of Christ, you will renew your
little lives and consecrate not only your hearts, but also all humanity to the Heart of My Son.

I ask you never to forget that the Eucharistic Body of Christ must be the most important thing in
your lives; for this sacred offering, which He made for humankind, will endure through the
centuries and into eternity, transforming hearts and spirits into offerings to the Creator.

 

Friar Elías del Sagrado Corazón de Jesús transmits the Words of the Virgin Mary:

Dear children, today I wear upon My Head a crown of roses. Will you, dear children, one day dare
to become one of those roses, so that I may present them before God as an offering of peace, a
possibility for your conversion?

Dear children, meditate on what I tell you.

Today, I also wish to thank the prayer groups of Mendoza and San Rafael, in Argentina, because
from there, from that nation, a servant of God was born, a living representative of Christ.

And in the month of October, dear children of all Argentina, the Humble Faithful Servant will go on
pilgrimage to your hearts to take you into My Arms, kiss you, welcome you and give you My Love,
in honor and gratitude for already responding to My call.

To all the pilgrims of Argentina, those who must awaken to Our Lady, I invite you to come to Me. I
invite the prayer groups of Argentina to unite as one heart of Light and become receivers of new
children of Mine, those who need to find peace and healing.

On this night that ends, beloved children, before the consecration of this state of Espírito Santo, I
wish to bring you the Spirit of God, the One who is always present in your essences and in those of
all My children.

Therefore, I invite you, children of Espírito Santo, to awaken the Divine Spirit of God in those who
cry out for redemption.

When My Heart rises tonight, holding your prayers in My Hands, to present them to God, I invite
you, dear children, to call upon the flight of the Holy Spirit.

I thank you, I bless your hearts, your families, all your loved ones, in the hope that you will
consecrate yourselves as the new family of Nazareth, the one that shall live in the Promised Land in
the next humanity.

I thank you for entering into My Immaculate Heart.

I love and bless you.

Take with you tonight, these flowers that I have consecrated, as a symbol of My Love for you and
of your love for Me.
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I thank you, My little ones!

In the name of the Father, the Son and the Holy Spirit. Amen.

Song: "Flight of the Holy Spirit."

 

Mother Maria Shimani de Montserrat:

We are going to share with you some things that Our Lady told us, before She began to deliver Her
Words. Let us start with Sister Lucía.

 

Sister Lucía de Jesús:

Today, during the prayer, some things happened that Our Lady asked us to share.

After the beginning, it was perceived that the guardian angels of many of us began to manifest and,
in front of the image of Our Lady, a Heaven was opening, one Heaven after another, and from that
Heaven, hosts of angels were descending.

Those angels arrived in front of our guardian angels and our guardian angels withdrew offerings
from within us and offered them to those angels who came from Heaven. And those offerings were
our fears, our misunderstandings, old sufferings that we kept in our hearts and that many allowed to
be carried away.

And, from that movement, when our angels had already offered everything, they began to make
other offerings; roses emerged from our hearts and those roses were taken by the angels coming
from Heaven.

Before that, some angels had descended with the image of the planet and stopped with that image of
the planet, that globe, in front of us. Then, our guardian angels took the roses and gave them to the
angels that came from Heaven, who placed them upon each of the nations. The first image of the
planet was somewhat dark and when the angels placed those roses, in the space where that rose
was, the planet became lighter, like a drop of water falling and the light expanded.

And later, during the Apparition, Our Lady explained this symbol to us. She said that rose was the
opening of our hearts, and thus, She explained to us how simple the conversion of the nations was,
it was a totally spiritual movement. The opening of our hearts allowed that love and that peace to
enter the nations.

 

Friar Elías del sagrado Corazón de Jesús:

Being before Our Lady kneeling was a great revelation given the history we have with Her.

Today, She came to us as the Queen of Peace, kneeling, and we could say that Heaven, together
with Her, was a meter away from us. All the angelic presence, as Sister Lucía described, was with
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Her, and we did not expect the visit of Jacinta and Sister Lucia, who were visionaries in Fatima.
And the devotion that they transmitted to us was sublime, profound and true.

Each prayer that they repeated with us, like the exercise that Our Mother asked us to perform
tonight, the prayers that emanated from them today elevated our beings and, in this way, they also
radiated the love that they had attained as beings on this Earth.

Today, we found ourselves before the contemplative Face of our Mother in prayer.

At one moment, while we were praying the Glory, She, still kneeling, called the angels who were
accompanying Her. They prostrated themselves lower than Her. She also prostrated Herself on the
ground, on the ground of Heaven and began to pray. When we began to pray the Glory, She joined
Her Hands and placed Her Hands on Her forehead and, while She was kneeling, She prayed for us,
She also prayed for those who were not present and for those who were accompanying us today.

After that moment, She blessed each one of us and placed Her Love within us. Today, She behaved
as a true Mother.

We felt that She was our Mother speaking to Her children, like Mary when She cared for Jesus;
such was the maternal gesture that She conveyed to us, and this gesture that She transmitted opened
our hearts.

Also, tonight, She greatly helped the state of Espírito Santo and we understood, according to the
requests of Our Mother, that in the prayers of all the brothers and sisters who live here, in this
state, there should always be the Presence of the Holy Spirit, they should always remember the Holy
Spirit. That is what our Mother was asking us today.

 

Mother Maria Shimani de Montserrat:

Our Lady, through each Apparition, is liberating all of Brazil from suffering, from pain and from
some old things that our planet has carried, from some mistakes made by humanity.

In these days that Our Lady has been in Espírito Santo, Her angels have taken away much suffering
that has been kept here for 500 years.

Therefore, now, it is up to all the inhabitants of Espirito Santo, through prayer, to maintain the
Light that Our Lady has left here.

We want to thank you for the warm welcome that you have given us in this place and, who knows, if
Our Lady has forseen it, we may return to this beautiful city.

And now, let us close our task, singing.

Thank you all very much!

 

Song: "Peace on Earth."


