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Monday, January 25, 2016

APPARITION OF THE VIRGIN MARY IN THE MARIAN CENTER OF AURORA, PAYSANDÚ,
URUGUAY, TO THE VISIONARY SISTER LUCÍA DE JESÚS

Dear children,

Today, My Heart arrives in this Kingdom of Healing for humanity with the purpose of liberating the
greatest possible number of souls from the abysses of this world.

Today, I place Myself upon this altar, not only as a symbol of My radiance over the Middle East,
but as a Truth, because this is how I remain at all times, crying out for this sacred land where I once
placed My Feet, which I wished to sanctify with the Presence of My Son.

When I was in the world, I felt in My Heart the hope that this planet could be sacred, because I
carried the Son of God in My Womb. I walked throughout the East and also across Europe, seeking
to extend the Kingdom of My Son, to announce His Return, His Resurrection, His Eternal Life.

I hoped that a New Jerusalem could arise, that long-awaited holy land, but there were not many who
truly listened to My Son, who followed His Words, made them come alive. 

Listening to Christ is not just about understanding His Words; it is about living them. That is why I
tell you that very few listened to Him. 

Although He walked among the crowds, many saw His miracles and were amazed by them, but only
a few made themselves into Christ's greatest miracle. And throughout these two thousand years,
very few have dared to live this miracle, this miracle that My Son perpetuated through the
Eucharist, in which He offers Himself every day to the human heart, renewing His Passion and His
offering to renounce Himself for the salvation of this world.

Every time you commune with Christ, every time you receive the Bread and Wine, in that moment
my Son relives His Passion and reconfirms, before God, His perpetual offering for this world and
for many others. 

For this reason, children, you must know how to stand before the Eucharist; you must remember,
every time you receive Communion, the sacred sacrifice of My Son Jesus, His Forgiveness and His
Mercy, because in this way, you will not only renew His suffering, but you will also renew His
Mercy, His Peace in the face of all events, His absolute Faith in the Creator, even crucified in the
face of death, His certainty of eternal life that, united with God, He would rise again.

I come to resurrect this world, to witness the resurrection of souls, just as I witnessed the
resurrection of my Son. 

I come to resurrect the Purpose of God in the human heart, so that It may not be lost, It may not fade
away.

My Heart accompanies you and sustains you, just as It inspired Christ to carry His sacrifice to the
very end. But if you want to follow the example of My Son and count on the help of My
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Immaculate Heart, you must be persistent, persevering in the Divine Purpose, regardless of the
results, regardless of what you call failures; because the laws of this world do not resemble the
Laws of Heaven. What may seem like a failure to human eyes is the great victory of the Creator.

Those of My children who renew their faith in the Middle East, despite all of the persecution, the
fear, the pain, are renewing the faith of the whole world, they are renewing the sacrifice of Christ,
they are turning the failure of a nation into the victory of God within its heart. 

It is for these children of Mine who never lose faith that My Heart can still intercede for Syria. With
their conviction to remain united to Christ, they open the doors to Me every day. 

But for My Immaculate Heart to triumph and for peace to reign there, as in all the countries of the
Middle East, I need more beings to experience true prayer, to confirm their union with Christ and to
discover that the true treasure is spiritual life, which transcends matter and all that it offers.

I also need, My children, more than just your prayers; I need you to become true apostles of Christ,
who are not afraid of living according to His Words, according to His Will, who announce to the
world, through example, the possibility of living in peace.

I would like to awaken you from the slumber in which you live and show you that what you have
given to God is still very little, before the great need in the world. My children, you still insist on
being children in the spiritual life, when planetary Armageddon invites you to act as spiritually
mature adults.

As much as you believe that you live a life of the spirit, your examples show that there is still a lot
of resistance within you. And I tell you this because you have made a commitment to God to be
those who drive the transformation of the planet; that is why I will help you, because of that
commitment you made in the beginning and which cannot be lost in the trivialities of your lives.

As time speeds up and the days lose their hours, I need you to fulfill your mission. Today, I show
you the planetary reality through the eyes of your hearts, so that you, My children, may awaken to
the truth, mature your spirits and no longer think so much about yourselves, your own comfort, your
own well-being, when it is time to serve, to give every last drop of sweat in the name of the One
who once sweated blood out of love for humanity. 

The One who is the example of your lives gave every last drop of His Blood and forgave every one
of His wounds, turning His wounds into a Source of Mercy for the whole world, as well as for the
cosmos. That is why He became King and today He invites you to imitate His footsteps, because
His sacrifice was not enough to convert this world as God expects.

My children, I sent you to the Middle East so that you could see with your own eyes what the
enemy causes within beings: pain and suffering, fear and resentment, which with great difficulty
will be torn out of these human hearts only through the effort of everyone, with prayer, with service,
with the sacrifice so feared by this humanity and which, in truth, is nothing more than its possibility
to unite with Christ and with what He represents for all of Creation.

Today, on this altar, I show you the realities of the spirit, which surpass what happens in matter, and
I do this so that, as humanity, you pray with Me and intercede for this world, because it is not
enough for My Divine Heart to cry out to God. He needs to hear the voice of humankind, invoking
His Mercy, praying as His Son taught you, to open the doors of Heaven and unite the human heart
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with His Most Sacred Heart once again.

Pray with me, accompany me with your heart, with your soul and with your conscience.

At that moment, the Divine Mother asked one of the priests present to pray the Our Father and the
Hail Mary in Arabic.

If you prayed from the heart every day, many things would be different in this world. If you did not
just pray with your mouth or your mind, but with your heart, if you cried out to God, if you begged
for His Divine Mercy, offering the sacrifice of His Son and the renewal of that sacrifice in the
Eucharist, you could convert many evils in this world. 

But humanity is still more interested in remaining in its own comfort zone, living out its own
aspirations, rather than converting the existence of this world, converting suffering, anguish,
darkness into light, into love and peace, into the establishment of the Kingdom of God.

Reflect, my children:

What prevents you from surrendering everything and becoming true servants? 

Is it that you do not believe in My Words or do you truly not understand the urgency of these
times? 

Are you not touched by the suffering of your brothers and sisters? 

Do you not see the need of the world, of those who die beside you, both in matter as in spirit? 

What do you do when you pass by a poor person on the street? Do you think that this is a spirit
created by God, who came to this world to fulfill a mission, to experience redemption and to learn
to love, or do you silence your thoughts so that you do not have to think, do not have to feel and just
remain indifferent to what they are experiencing?

Children, the Armageddon will one day knock on the doors of your homes and will expect to find
you ready. At that time, you will wish that there were beings who had surrendered out of love, who
could help you when you have lost everything. You will wish that there were souls who gave their
lives to God to pray for you and so that your souls may have a chance in the Kingdom of Heaven. 

The Middle East, like many places in the world, already needs your prayers. The Armageddon has
already arrived on the physical plane for them, it is not just spiritual or mental.

Will you allow Mercy to spring forth from within you and let the needs of your brothers and sisters
be greater than your own? Will you realize the need of those already suffering in this world or will
you continue to pray for your own illnesses and only pray from the heart when it concerns your
families?

I need consciences that live for the salvation of this world, not just for one or two, but for all! And
for your offering to reach the planet, it must be a true, complete and absolute offering.

I will let My Words resound in your hearts and I hope that you have truly listened to Me.
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Now I will call these little souls who have decided to deepen their offering to My Immaculate Heart
and, tonight, I will ask them to truly reflect on whether they are willing to endure anything to
establish My Peace; whether they will overcome the conflicts in their lives, in their families and in
their daily routine to become true peacemakers; whether they will establish peace through their own
example;  whether they will not fear wearing this shirt, the symbol of My Mantle over their bodies,
when the time comes to confirm their faith. 

A soldier, My children, does not remove his uniform at the time of battle; he gives his life for the
purpose he must fulfill.

My Immaculate Heart is forming an army of peace, with souls who will not fear suffering or losing
themselves to bring this peace into the world. I want you to know this, and when you raise your
hands to consecrate yourselves as Children of Mary, you understand what you are doing. I will
always strengthen you, always guide you, I will accompany your steps, but I will also ask you to
confirm yourselves and to be true to the commitment you have made to me.

That is why today I bless you and reconsecrate your souls, for in truth, all Children of Mary have
already been consecrated to my Heart since the beginning. When you kneel at My altar, you are
simply confirming that you accept to live in redemption. May you one day spread this purpose and
may many souls be inspired by your consecration. Set an example to the world of surrender,
transparency, simplicity and peace. Show the path to my Kingdom not only through prayers, but
also through actions.

I bless you and ask you that you do not forget what I have told you. Lift your offerings to my altar; I
hear your petitions. Do not be afraid to ask, for I will always grant you what you need, as long as
you are consistent with your faith; but do not ask only for yourselves, also ask for the planet,
because God is listening. Speak to the Heart of the Father as you did not speak on the day He waited
for you. 

God remains silent, because He is Silence itself. Despite the indifference of humanity, His Heart has
never stopped pouring out Love upon the world, and He continues to await the response of the souls
of this Earth.

As I ascend, pray once more to the Heavenly Father, so that I may reach the foot of His Altar with
the offering of humanity.

Today I will ask you for a different kind of consecration: consecrate yourselves for this planet and
not just for yourselves. That is why, as I ascend, I will ask that you sing the Our Father in Arabic,
sending to the Lord the confirmation that you aspire to be by His side and to fulfill His Plan.

I await you and listen to you.

 

At that moment, those present heard the members of the monastery chant the Our Father in Arabic.

 

I bless you, in the name of the Father, the Son and the Holy Spirit. Amen.

 



Association Mary
Apparition of Virgin Mary

Voice and Echo of the Divine Messengers
www.mensajerosdivinos.org

Sister Lucía de Jesús:

Brothers and sisters, we just wanted to share with everyone, as Mary asked us to, that from the
beginning of the prayer, Our Lady was already working in the Middle East. That is why the angels
asked us to sing the Hail Mary in Arabic.

And throughout the prayer, we could see that She was there, not only in Syria, but also in other
countries, in the midst of the conflicts, radiating Her peace, as if She were walking in disguise
among the people who lived there.

When She arrived, She wore different clothing, as if She had on a traditional Muslim outfit, with
headscarves wrapped around Her head, but I could see that Her face remained uncovered. Her
garments were a darker shade of blue with some white details.

Behind Our Lady, I saw some places in the Middle East, very difficult situations, because She was
showing us not only what was happening on the physical  plane, but also what was happening on
the spiritual plane. She said that She was doing this, in part, to mature our consciousness, as She
always does, so that we could feel the need of the world as slightly greater than our own.

And when we prayed the Our Father in Arabic along with the Hail Marys, Our Lady prayed with us,
and the angels prayed with Her too, and they were removing many negative spiritual entities from
some places in the Middle East. They were very strong images, which we share with everyone
because Our Lady asked us to. And She removed these entities, sometimes from deserts, sometimes
from inside family homes or from political and religious group meetings. And She continued this
work until the end of the Apparition.

She remained working in the Middle East while talking to each one of us, while trying to awaken
our conscience. And now, at the end, when She asked the brothers and sisters to sing the Our
Father in Arabic, I saw the planet from above; it is hard to explain, because while Our Lady was
still present, I saw this image of the planet, and how an intense brilliant white Light began to
descend from the universe. It was as though our consciousness was entering into the planet and
seeing the surface of the Earth in greater and greater details.

This Light came like a white sun, with the energy of the Consciousness of God, until it reached the
Middle East. And I saw the Middle East in deep darkness, destroyed, then this Light began to travel
through the spaces; splitting and multiplying into small Lights that began to enter homes, schools
full of refugees, hospitals, filling the interior of souls.

What we felt was truly sublime, something that transcended that image, because Our Lady also
allowed us to feel the Presence of God there. And as this moment drew to a close, Our Lady told us
that this was how She hoped we would always pray, in Her Presence, with Her, so that the
Consciousness of God may continually descend upon the planet.

And in the moment She asked us to speak to God, She showed us, behind Her, different portals that
led to the Cosmos. And it is also difficult to describe, but it was as if the Consciousness of God was
there, watching us. He was not a person, He did not have a material form as we imagine. It was just
a Life, a Light, which we could feel was observing us and listening to us. He had no shape, yet He
was in everything all at once. And in that moment, He listened to what each one of us had to say to
Him.
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We leave everyone with the Words of Mary in our hearts and with this account, which we hope will
deepen what She told us.

May we all remain with Our Lady in our hearts.

Thank You, Mother, for all that You give us!


