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APPARITION OF THE VIRGIN MARY IN BRASILIA, BRAZIL, TO THE VISIONARIES FRIAR ELÍAS
DEL SAGRADO CORAZÓN DE JESÚS AND SISTER LUCÍA DE JESÚS

Friar Elías del Sagrado Corazón de Jesús transmits the Words of the Virgin Mary:

I am grateful, on this evening, to all who responded to My Call. This has an important merit in
Heaven, from the moment that you return to the House of God.

As the Mother of the Americas, I come to bring peace to this continent. I unite peoples, races and
origins; and I believe, in these times, the new culture over the face of the Earth, the New Christs
who awaken to the redeeming call.

Therefore, dear children, as the Mother of Brasilia, I come to ask you something very important, to
continue praying every day, My Immaculate Heart listens to you offers.

I come in this final time, to untie the knots of the consciousness, to liberate the ties of the path of
My children; therefore, with my sword I cut all the events of evil.

I only ask you, dear children, not to forget, in this final era, to unite to My Immaculate Heart. My
immaculate Heart will be your eternal home, where you will be protected from yourselves and from
the world.

I come in this final era, to ask you simple things, because many miracles have already been realized
over the centuries. My Son gave testimony of His Presence over the centuries, and at His request, I
did too.

Therefore, dear children, open your hearts. Open your hearts to listen to the Will of God; thus, you
will be able to leave superficial things, your suffering will be calmed, and healing will be born in
your spirits, because you will be consequent with Me in prayer, and I will be able to continue
interceding for you.

As I have said to you today, I need awake and available souls, who can listen to the Voice of God in
this time. Therefore, My Immaculate Spirit travels the nations to show you that you are one race,
you are the new Christic civilization that must be born. Therefore, listen to your hearts, calm your
minds and thoughts so that the Divine Energy can flow in you and the Holy Spirit can show you
how much needs to be done in these delicate times.

I do not only need your hearts, but also your immediate availability. I need to ignite within you the
stars of the Confederation, those waiting to shine as suns over the face of the Earth.

Dear children, I come at the request of Christ to awaken you. In previous times, very few listened to
My Call. I come, in this era, to renew things in the name of Christ; but for this to happen, beloved
children, you must take the first step towards Me, then everything will happen as foreseen in
Heaven.
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I come to prevent massive things in this world; just like I did in Fatima, Medjugorje, Lourdes and
other points of the Earth that you do not know.,

Over the centuries, I come to announce the important Call for peace; but since the cup is already so
full, there is something that must be done, dear children; before it is completely spilled, you must
awaken in time. Everything can be reversed through a good and healthy attitude.

I come to open your hearts, to consecrate your inner temples in a favored union with God the
Father.

Dear children, I assure you that, in the end of times, you will remember My Words, everything that
I am saying to you this evening and, what will you do in this difficult time?

I come to help and assist you. I come as Mother of all humanity to intercede for all of My children;
what else do you need to take the step?

Those who still follow Me are trying very hard, but I need many more hands that can work with Me
for the Return of Christ. I need to give you, in the depths of your hearts, visible signs of the Coming
of Christ; to be able to identify it and not be deceived before all false ones that will arise.

My Son is unique and glorified. His Sacred Heart is unmistakable. I come in the name of Christ to
offer you the Most Sacred Heart of Jesus. You are in the time of being able to consecrate yourselves
to His Heart; in this way, you will be protected from things that will happen, because when
everything happens, dear children, I will once again be in Heaven, accompanying you with the force
of My prayer.

These descents that I make to the Earth, manifesting My universal and maternal Consciousness, are
unique and determinant in this final cycle.

I come to give you that which I learned in the universe. I need you to merge as one group of souls,
that there no longer exist among you lies and indifferences, ego or error. Heal your hearts through
My Heart, feel My Call of Peace in your lives. I need your fervor and devotion so that the Peace that
exists in Heaven may descend on Earth.

My one Purpose, dear beloveds, is to fulfil the Plan of God over the Earth through your lives, your
families and all your dear beings. Thus, you will help Me, dear children, so that the world may
achieve peace.

 

Sister Lucía de Jesús transmits the Words the Virgin Mary:

Because this Portal of Peace opened on this night over this city to dissolve all of the darkness that is
so rooted on this ground.

But so that My Light can penetrate the abysses and dissolve the power of the enemy within human
hearts, I need the permission of your hearts, I need awakened souls to balance souls that are
sleeping today; and, more than this, My children, that Marian soldiers balance those children of
Mine who have lost the way and who are not asleep, but rather are consciously soldiers of darkness.
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On this evening, My children, My Angels and Archangels descend to this world. Their swords of
Light cut the ties with evil, but, so that these swords pass through your lives and untie them from
darkness, definitively, I need your yes, a true and definitive yes, of souls who give themselves to the
Higher Will.

I come to this world to carry out true spiritual miracles in the lives of all creatures.

My children, My Heart penetrates the abysses and desperation of this Earth, and there is no place in
this world where My Light cannot enter. Yes, there are places where the human heart does not allow
Me to reach, but if one of your souls truly surrenders to God, the Lord will give Me permission so
that My Kingdom can expand in this world.

Because, My dears, My eyes contemplate the planet from My Kingdom and I pray permanently,
because I observe that souls of this world suffer much every day.

Today, I call you to be able to leave your small lives a bit so that, through the prayer of the heart,
you may be instruments of God and assist the Creator so that, through His Servant, the souls that
fall into the abysses of this planet can be rescued.

I see from Heaven, My children, that in every instant a consciousness is lost in the world, that
darkness wants to take the Kingdom of My Peace, but it is possible for this not to happen; it is
possible, My dears, for you to learn through Love and not through suffering, for you to see the
world falling apart in front of your eyes, but your hearts are within the Heart of God, and nothing
that is outside this Most Sacred Heart disturbs you.

My dears, I want you to awaken this evening to a Higher Life, because My Divine Presence comes
to open your hearts and consciousnesses so that you no longer sleep the dream of the illusions of
this world. Elevate your aspirations to My Heart, because today My arms are open to receive each
of your needs. I listen to your supplications and I know the reason for which each of your hearts
comes to meet Me.

On this evening, I tell you that those who truly decide to be soldiers of My army, to no longer
preoccupy yourselves with your anguishes and afflictions because, upon surrendering to the Heart
of God, the Light of My Celestial Kingdom will dissolve all of these anguishes and transform them
into a source of divine inspiration, into a will that your souls will feel to overcome fears, to
overcome suffering and to go towards the great need of this world.

My dears, as I have told you on this day, I want to invite you to carry out small sacrifices, small
works of charity, which little by little will convert this world.

My beloveds, today I open My arms and show you My Immaculate Heart, so that before your eyes,
you may have the Higher Dwelling, to which you must return in this time. Come without delay and
without fear, because nothing evil will happen to you, a profound peace will enter you lives, an
unbreakable devotion and faith, so that, finally, My children, you can be converted into the Christs
of the New Time, similar to My Son, similar to God the Father.

 

Friar Elías del Sagrado Corazón de Jesús transmits the Words of the Virgin Mary:
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I thank you for trusting in this Call. I want to tell you, dear children, that My Graces were deposited
in your hearts and families.

Adore, all the time, the Grace of God. Contemplate His Majesty and Mercy; because what I can
give you are the Codes of God, the principles of the Primordial Source, that are born in love and
unity. This is available for all in the vast Universe of the Creator; it is enough, dear children, that
you only ask Heaven, and Heaven will give you all of its legacy, all of Its Redemption and Mercy.

I dismiss your hearts in the name of Peace and invite, to this Altar, the new children that today I will
consecrate and the group of Brasilia that prepared this meeting with Me; because they will also be
consecrated to my Immaculate Heart, with the hope that all of them can be the living heart for
Brazil, the heart that beats in love, peace and prayer.

I bless these flowers that will be for the present, the symbol of My Universal Mystical Rose, of the
beauty that God gestated through My Immaculate Heart. I consecrate the sacred images so that they
can be a living symbol of Light in these times of darkness.

I bless you and contemplate you. And, now, I will listen to your voices singing to God, for the final
consecration.

For all this and for the days that will come, I thank you for responding to My Call.

Go in peace, live in My Peace, be bearers of My Peace.

Hallelujah to God!

 

Song: Hail Mary (in Latin).

 

Friar Elías del Sagrado Corazón de Jesús:

We place our hands facing up to receive the Grace of Our Lady.

 

Friar Elías del Sagrado Corazón de Jesús transmits the Words of the Virgin Mary:

My dear children, My last request will be for you: pray every day that will come for My pilgrimage
to the United States. Through your offer and donation to my Immaculate Heart, a great door to
conversion will open in this place.

I gather you in the name of Christ. I congregate you through the strength of His Spirit. I unite you to
the Source of His infinite Mercy, now and always.

In the name of the Father, the Son and the Holy Spirit. Amen.

"Mary of Nazareth" is a song that gladdens My heart and makes My Spirit ignite souls in a
perpetual devotion. Let us joyfully sing for God on this evening.


