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Tuesday, October 27, 2015
Special daily Message of Mary, Rose of Peace, transmitted in the city of Caracas, Venezuela to the
visionary Friar Elías del Sagrado Corazón

To My children consecrated as Children of Mary and to all of the pilgrims of the entire world  

Today, before the universe, I have the joy of having My Heart of a Mother be widely accepted by
all My children of Venezuela, who today are enduring the consequences of a worldwide food
crisis.  

During My important visit to this nation, I received the deep and true call of each one of them, just
as in other moments I received the inner call of each pilgrim.

It is for this just and worthy cause that the Most Sacred Hearts, in a special way and under Their
Spiritual Will, are sending the entire missionary group to the Great Savanna of Venezuela, so that
the Sacred Center of Roraima and all Venezuelans have the opportunity to receive very important
assistance from the Spiritual Hierarchy. 

This will require the missionary group to travel throughout all of the territory of Venezuela, in
prayer, up to the Great Savanna, just as My Son explicitly requested. Which will mean carrying out
a special mission of reconversion of hearts, of  liberation from the webs of evil and, mainly, of
awakening and confirmation of the spiritual mission of each child of Venezuela.

Through this labor-intensive task that the missionary group will carry out, it will prevent South
America and all of its inhabitants from being conquered by an ideal of restriction and oppression.
Children, in truth I say to you that you could not imagine Latin America in such a reality. It is for
this reason that the Heavenly Hierarchy contemplated the need of Its children, as It did in Colombia,
and Heaven responded to the request of all of the groups of the Light-Network of Venezuela.

So that the Americas may be consecrated to My Immaculate Heart, all of the groups of the Light-
Network must be closely accompanied, because it will be through each group that some events will
be avoided.

This mission to the Great Savanna of Venezuela will involve the fraternal transfer of the Marathon
of Divine Mercy of the 5th and the 6th of November of 2015 to the city of Boa Vista, in the State
of Roraima, Brazil.

It will also be in this way that the Christic energy of the Merciful Christ will be able to penetrate the
consciousness of this whole region and, especially in all of the Plant Kingdom of the Amazon,
which is rapidly disappearing.

If the Amazon should come to disappear, the planet would lose one of its great natural lungs.  It is
for this reason that the angels will also intercede for the whole of the angelic and devic
consciousness.
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I ask each child of Mary for the Grace of understanding and of acceptance in total trust, maturity
and in the operation of a rescue as a task for all of the servers of the Plan of God.

Children, each place that the Divinity visits is unique. There, in those moments, many doors that
repress the souls of the world can be closed.  As you will see, My children, the planet and all of its
consciousness are suffering.  If the Divinity were not to suddenly carry out these spiritual actions,
which break the control over the material and monetary life, certain realities of the world would
succumb overnight.

Dear children of Brazil, I ask that you, who together are responsible for your nation and of the
Amazon, support the next Marathon of Prayer in the city of Boa Vista, which will attempt to restore
many situations. 

I wish to especially say to the groups of the Light-Network of the south of Brazil that I will be
present with you on the 12th and 13th of November of 2015, in the city of Porto Alegre,
Brazil.  Venezuela waited a long time for this opportunity and for this Grace; it is time that you
mature in fellowship and in cooperation, because the planet and its sacred centers belong to all of
humanity.  

I thank you for the inner union of all the groups of the Light-Network because My hands work
through them for all of humanity.

In hope and in the Plan of salvation,

Your Mother Mary, Rose of Peace


