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SPECIAL MESSAGE OF SAINT JOSEPH, TRANSMITTED IN THE CITY OF LISBON, PORTUGAL, TO
THE VISIONARY SISTER LUCÍA DE JESÚS 

Tell me, do you fear anything?

The time has come for you to establish your surrender, as it is for all servers and truly consecrated
to the Plan of God.

So, tell me: do you fear anything?

It is time to place your imperfection in the Hands of God and no longer try to be the potter of the
clay that you are. Child, it is time for the most beautiful songs about surrendering one's life to
become true now, and for you to be a living song and all those who see you may be able to listen to
it and be inspired by it.

The time to establish one's own surrender comes for everyone; it is when they feel least prepared for
this because surrender is not established before it is consummated. It is in the very act of
surrendering the heart that the spirit anchors its foundations in the matter, and the soul matures and
expresses its consecration to God. Everything that comes before this is a preparation.

Tell me, do you fear anything?

I come to make you feel My Love, and that together with the Love of My Son, may dispel from
your heart, the fear of not corresponding to the Plan of God.

I come with the Love of the Father imprinted on my humble spirit, the same Love that made me
surrender everything to fulfill the Will of God from the beginning; this Love that called me like a
magnet, life after life, to return to God.

Today, may this Love impregnate your being, strengthen you and place you before the greatness of
the Plan of God, which goes far beyond this life and that has in it its beginning and its end in
eternity and unity.

May this greatness inspire you to lose fear and have the integrity to walk with the determined steps
of a spirit that is guided by God. Because if you read these words today, it is so.

So, tell Me now that there is no more fear in your heart, no more fearfulness or pain, for the pain
that there is in you does not belong to you and must be transmuted by the power of Grace.

Tell Me, then, with simplicity, that you will follow the Divine Will and that you will place yourself
in the Hands of the true and only Potter that can mold you.

Child, it is with your imperfection that He will fulfill His Plan, just as He did with Mine, and will
make you a new vase, to fill it with the new life that will permeate the Earth.
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Before that, during the great Work that the Lord carries out in His, be simple and humble, and
everything will be as God thought, even if one day you discover that His Thought did not resemble
yours at all.

Tell me, then, that there is no more fear, and with my blessing upon your heart, rest in peace, rest in
sacrifice and self-giving, for the time of your surrender has come.

Your Father and Friend,

The Most Chaste Saint Joseph


