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Tuesday, July 4, 2017

SPECIAL MESSAGE OF CHRIST JESUS, TRANSMITTED FOR THE 48.ª MARATHON OF THE DIVINE
MERCY, IN THE CITY OF SANTIAGO DE COMPOSTELA, LA CORUÑA, SPAIN, TO THE VISIONARY
FRIAR ELÍAS DEL SAGRADO CORAZÓN

Here is the Sacred Ark of God, which holds the greatest treasures of the Universe.

It will return with Me to the Earth to institute the new Plan of God at the moment of the emergence
of a new humanity.

I will return more brilliant than a sun and more luminous than hundreds of stars.

My Spirit will be as fleeting as the wind and similar to the force of the oceans and of all the seas.

A Portal of the Universe will open on the Earth, and the one hundred and forty-four thousand will
feel it because they will hear My Voice in their hearts and they will know that the hour is
approaching.

It will be the moment in which God will have declared His Justice over the world, and the
unbelievers, the unjust will know it.

This is why I come to offer this Sacred Ark as a last salvation for humanity.

Within it I have placed My Sacred Heart full of thorns so that it may be venerated, adored, and
restored by humanity.

The angels will participate in this event of the Coming of the Son of Man, and there will be no
consciousness that will remain unaware, because God is already putting an end to human injustices,
to all that is sin, and to all that is lost.

As I did more than two thousand years ago in the Holy Land, I come to offer My Heart as a symbol
of universal atonement so that souls may find a safe refuge and know how to act in the coming
times, without losing the possibility of being guided.

With all of this, I come to reveal to you the mysteries of My Sacred Heart, which are not truly
contemplated nor sought by all in these times.

I have chosen this place to do it, because one of Mine has come here; they have come in My Name
to leave something that humanity has not understood and has changed that opportunity into a
perdition for many souls.

But My Mercy is infinite, greater than all the oceans and all of the Universe.

My Fount of Grace will never stop flowing, but I must be obedient to My Father, just as you must
be obedient to the Law and to Justice.
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My Grace will not end, but I must have it cease at some point. Because of this, in these times, I
come to strengthen you to try to make your lives new instruments that can respond to the need of
My Plan and of My urgent return to the world.

While the world is unjust to all that I have given it through My Sacrifice and the Cross, through a
profaning of the Word, of the Divine Verb, and of the Eucharist, it will still suffer more than it
expects.

This is why I come with so few to change the events and make of your incarnations a moment of
renewal and of hope for the world.

I would like you pray to Me every day as you have prayed today.

I would like you to walk towards the Portal of Peace every day as you have walked today, in
simplicity, in love, and in attunement.

This has allowed Me to come here to gather up the purgatories that exist in all of Europe.

When your feet walk with determination and firmness toward My Portal of Peace, I can do many
things through you; and all those that I can do are very unknown to humanity.

Today you have allowed My Father to grant the bringing of the Ark of the Sacred Covenant here,
under the deep veneration of My Sacred Heart, which is within it as essence and energy.

I want your eyes to observe the horizon of My Heart, the Universe of My Love, and the Divinity of
My Consciousness, and that you are able to believe that beyond all this there is something greater
and more real, which the world still does not know.

Today I was able to leave in your hearts the Dwellings of My Father, those dwellings of which I
have spoken in the Gospels, in the New Testament.

I want you to pray not only for yourselves, but also for the unfaithful and selfish world; for those
who use My Name and the Name of My Mother to promote themselves and have many
consciousnesses believe that all of it is true.

You do not know how much My Heart feels when you distort things, as purpose and as celestial
design.

I have nothing else to give you but My Heart and My Life, My Soul and My Divinity.

I aspire to be in Mine much more than what I Am.

I aspire to be able to convert what I am not yet allowed.

I aspire to be able to liberate what is still resistant within you, out of fear or shame.

My Eyes of Mercy do not come to see what is not right, but rather they come to see what My Father
has created in the depths of your consciousnesses, from the Beginning.

It is for the essence of the souls of the world that I pray every day, at the foot of a luminous cross
similar to this one, which is beside My altar.
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On this Cross I gave everything for all, and much more than what humanity knows through stories
or tales, through experiences or visions.

God will never completely reveal His Mystery, because He knows that humanity is weak in the
flesh and in temptation.

But yes, He can give all His treasures and what exists beyond this Universe to those who have faith
in Him, to those who believe His Word, to those who live in His Will and respect it, to those who
fully trust in His Merciful Love.

The world is very sick in body, in mind, and in spirit.

Who will assist this wounded world full of injuries?

A world that suffers as a consciousness, through humanity and the Kingdoms that My Father has
created for its benefit, for the benefit of His creatures.

I am like a tree, waiting for you to contemplate Me.

I am like the birds, waiting to be praised.

I am like the sea, so that you seek Me in the silence.

I am in the wind, so that you may recognize the caress of My Love in all that has been created.

My Love, which is the Love of My Father, is in everything, awaiting reparation and healing.

May the brave feel encouraged to follow Me.

May the persevering not become weary of following in My footsteps. 

May the imperfect not become frightened.

May the sick believe in the Power of My Healing, and may the peacemakers not cease to bring
peace, no matter what happens.

Because in truth I tell you, happy will be those who do greater things than the ones I did, because in
Heaven they will be crowned for living and seeking My Humility; because in the Universe they will
be recognized as My servants of the end of times, and as the saints of the last days.

Offer your little sufferings for those who suffer the most.

The planet as a whole, as consciousness, is the greatest pain for this Universe.

I will return in Glory to correct this human project and this great idea, divine and immaculate, that
My Father emanated from His Heart into Infinity.

When you see that evil makes everything tremble and that the greatest difficulties of the Work
present themselves, know that My enemy is uneasy, because I am taking firm steps on the path to
My Return.

May the torches of the New Christs come alight. 
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May the banners of rehabilitation be raised. 

May the flags of peace be seen at the top of the hills, because the end is coming, although many do
not believe. 

Take refuge in the Immaculate Heart of My Mother. 

Pray, worship, and wait in silence, because a significant sign will come to pass, and you must not be
distracted and unable to see it.

This sign will indicate the end of the very end and the arrival of the Omega to humanity. 

The Sacred Books will finish being written because the Woman Clothed with the Sun will open the
new coffer, where the most precious pearls of redemption will be presented before the Thrones of
Our Lord. 

The Archangel Gabriel will announce to His angels the moment of My arrival, and the last trumpet
in the Celestial Universe will be heard. Woe to those that do not do penance!

Justice will be very great for what humanity has done, but My Mercy will save the one who truly
surrenders for themselves and for their brothers and sisters. 

Search no longer for the chaff in someone else's eye. Judge no longer, criticize no longer. 

Be merciful as I Am, until the end of the cross, until you are pierced by the spear of the Love of Our
Father.

Even at that time, do not give up, because even though I am apparently not present, My Divine
Spirit will always be in the one who believes and experiences My Trust. 

May this Ark be the symbol of the newly redeemed that peacefully venerate My Sacred Heart, and
do it for a lost and indifferent race. 

Happy will be those who do so, because they will never lack faith. 

The Kingdom of God draws near to pour out His Justice, and I will do everything possible and a
little more for the fallen. So be it. 

I will pray in these days along with you so that these roses that you have brought to My Altar may
be blessed, and on the third day of this meeting you take them as a gift of light from My Sacred
Heart, and as part of the donation of the Kingdoms of Nature to humanity, an unconditional
donation. 

In this Marathon let us pray for those that do not live My Commandments, for those who violate the
Laws of the Universe every day, for those who are religious and spiritual and are not true, so that
the Holy Spirit open their eyes and break the locks of their hearts; so that the Grace of My Merciful
Heart descends and souls be rescued from their abysses. Amen.

While I rise up to the Universe with all the pleas received, in this hour I need you to ease My Heart
of all that It sees, day to day, in this world.
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And I am here for those who listen to Me, for those who live Me, for those who search for Me, for
those who believe in their Divine Lord. 

I need you to restore My Heart today with a song, so deep for Me. 

I am here with you, and through this song you will say: Lord, You are here always. 

I bless you with the saving power of the Cross, with the luminous sign of redemption and of peace,
so that impure spirits may be liberated, and so that souls may find peace, in the name of the Father,
the Son, and the Holy Spirit. Amen. 


