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Friday, August 8, 2025

SPECIAL APPARITION OF CHRIST JESUS, THE VIRGIN MARY, AND SAINT JOSEPH AT THE
MARIAN CENTER OF FIGUEIRA, MINAS GERAIS, BRAZIL, TO THE VISIONARY SISTER LUCÍA DE
JESÚS

In the name of the Father, the Son and the Holy Spirit. Amen.

 

Come, Holy Spirit,
illuminate the hearts,

so that they may achieve
the Transfiguration of Jesus.

Amen.

(nine times)

 

The Voice of the Virgin Mary:

Just as I once gathered the apostles at the Cenacle of the Lord so that they would receive the Holy
Spirit of God, today I gather My children again, at the Cenacle of My Marian Centers, a Cenacle
that extends throughout the world today, throughout the homes and hearts that listen to Me, so that,
gathered around My Heart, they may receive the Holy Spirit of God.

At this Cenacle, dear children, the gift of the Holy Spirit that I bring to you today will not allow you
to speak in tongues, but it will allow you to make silence, to learn how to find God in your own
hearts, how to have the right word, but above all true silence, the one that silences human aspects,
that silences the inner purifications and lets you know the truth of your hearts, which hides behind
all the feelings, thoughts and actions that humanity lives through today.

At this Cenacle, My children, at the Pentecost of the last times, the Holy Spirit of God comes to
teach you to be in the heart of the Father in the face of any circumstance, to find wisdom,
discernment and peace in times of dissociation and madness. For this reason, come to meet Me, just
as to meet the Lord, with willing hearts, so that they may be renewed, transformed and healed by
the Presence of the Holy Spirit of God.

Today Our Sacred Hearts are before you so that you may contemplate Us with the eyes of the heart.
Our Sacred Presence brings Heaven to Earth and opens the doorways of the Higher Universes so
that the different Hierarchies of Creation may contemplate the Earth and its creatures and may cause
the impulses sent by the Creator to descend between the dimensions.

Allow the mirrors of your hearts to be ignited so that they may capture, from the Higher Mirrors of
the Cosmos, the impulses for this new cycle.
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As the Mother of the Mirrors and the Mother of Peace, today I bring you the Grace of receiving and
recognizing the Divine Rays, not only the Material and Immaterial Rays, but also those that come
from My Divine Consciousness, from the Sources of the twelfth dimension and beyond.

These Rays, My children, which come from the Origin, reach creatures through Mirrors so that they
may transcend the human condition, so that they may transcend the apparent confusion of these
times and may elevate the consciousness, so that they may really and definitively walk upon the
waters of the chaos of the world.

So that you may sustain the impulses that We bring you and that you may allow them to become life
in your lives, you need to sustain each impulse through prayer.

You already know, children, because We have been telling you constantly over the last few years,
that prayer is your protection and safety, prayer is what will keep you beyond the dimensions of
chaos. For this reason, do not cease to pray. Give importance and value to each moment, because it
is they who will sustain, in the world, the Graces that still can descend upon the Earth.

Today I bring you one of the Primordial Divine Rays: the Ray of Unity.

Just as your hearts cry out for the healing of your deepest wounds, for the transformation of your
ingrained understanding, for the liberation of your hearts from ignorance and from the desire to
prevail over others, today the Celestial Universes open to pour out Divine Unity upon humanity.

May your hearts be awake, open and willing, so that this energy may not only overflow in your
consciousness as so many other Graces you have received, but that it may find space and a place to
remain, to overcome, within you, everything that battles for disunity today.

Today, the Three Sacred Hearts are before you because it is only through Our united Presence that
you will be able to receive this Divine Ray. None of Us alone can grant to humanity the Grace to
cross the celestial doorways in consciousness and receive the Divine Rays from Immaterial Sources.
But Our united Hearts, in supplication and intercession, together with each one of you, can indeed,
My children, bring incalculable Graces to the planet, far beyond human merits and worthiness.

This is how Divine Mercy works on the cosmic level and above: not only by removing souls from
abysses and ignorance, but also by granting them Graces that not even the loftiest creatures of the
universe have been able to know and receive. It is through the human consciousness of this sacred
project of redemption that the creatures of the universe will be able to touch the Divine Graces.

Therefore, feel that you are responsible and place your consciousnesses beyond human
superficiality and that which you know as difficulties, tests, problems, so that you, children, may be
at the service of a Higher Plan. It is so that you may have your consciousness at that point that Our
Sacred Hearts are here.

Allow yourselves to rise in the name of all of humanity. Allow yourselves to be transmuted, healed
and liberated so that you may be empty before God. This is the Grace that, through the Mirrors of
the Cosmos, My Immaculate Heart comes to bring to you.

 

Sister Lucía de Jesús:
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Let us listen to Our Lord, Christ Jesus.

 

The Voice of Christ Jesus:

After My Sacred Passion and Death, when discouragement took over the hearts of My companions
and, although they had been with Me and listened to My Words, they felt unworthy, they felt
imperfect, they sought reason in the human consciousness, they thought: who would guide them?
Who would be worthy? Who would be right? Who could be obeyed? Who could bring the Power of
God to Earth?

They felt lost, defeated, as if all they had lived with Me had suddenly disappeared from their
consciousness.

The human condition overtook their consciousness and even the deepest spaces of their hearts. Just
as miseries, sins and human darkness were transmuted by Me in the three days before My
Resurrection, they also emerged in My companions, in My apostles and disciples and also in some
holy women.

This situation was like that so that they could transmute and deeply liberate humanity from all
human sludge, from all darkness that dwelled in the depths of the human consciousness, and so that
they could do it together with Me, even if they could not understand it.

Today you live something similar, you can see, emerging from within yourselves, as well as from
those around you, the darkest things, the sins, the miseries and that which often makes you forget all
the graces and blessings you have received up to this point.

You often forget that you are brethren on the path, and allow the need for power and the desire to
prevail over others win within yourselves.

It is not by seeking to determine who is right that you will be fulfilling My Will. It is not by seeking
the certainty of being on the right path or not that you will find this path.

Allow Me to cleanse you and renew you, so that you may understand this afternoon that, despite so
much confusion, this is My Will. Do not feel guilty, do not be ashamed for not having taken the
steps that, according to your conscience, you should have taken, but rather, in humility, allow
yourselves to come again to the Feet of the Creator, knowing your imperfections, miseries and sins,
so that He, in this cycle, may grant a new opportunity to you.

Just as I was hidden from My companions and apostles, I was also hidden from your hearts. And
now I am once again with you.

Just as I was with My companions after the Resurrection, you will find Me on different paths. I will
walk with you to Emmaus. You will often not recognize Me, but if you open your hearts to love and
forgiveness, if you decide to reconcile with one another, then you will know, children, that I Am
with you, that I not only live beside you, in a space, in a time or place, but I also live within your
hearts whenever you allow Me to be there.

Live these times as a service, allowing the worst that still exists in the human consciousness to be
washed away from within you.
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Allow My Love to cleanse, transmute and transform you, through a humble heart, so that you may
know what else I want for your lives.

 

Sister Lucía de Jesús:

Let us listen to the Chaste Heart of Saint Joseph.

 

The Voice of Saint Joseph:

May this rain be the symbol of the Grace that descends upon you from the Higher Universes.

You can approach this altar, so that you may give shelter and warmth to your brothers and sisters.

One day, children, Our Sacred Hearts also needed shelter.

Today this rain unites you.

Just as you gather together to be in the shelter of this House of Mine, you must be in consciousness
in the same way, surrounded by the Grace that descends from Heaven, together and united in the
shelter of the Sacred Hearts.

See the symbols of the spiritual life in each situation of your lives. Learn to read the messages of
nature, those that transmit the Grace of God, but also those that summon you to serve.

Nature speaks to the hearts of human beings, learn how to listen to it.

To seal and consummate this Divine Cenacle, let us sing together "Ruach Ha Koidesh" so that the
Holy Spirit of God, manifested today in all dimensions, even physically through the rain, may touch
what is deepest in your spirits, and become live in your lives.

We bless, consecrate and heal you, so that you may receive the Divine Gift of Unity.

In the name of the Father, the Son and the Holy Spirit. Amen.

 

Song: "Ruach Ha Koidesh."


